

4.02(1)

Perry Primary Demolition Bid

December 2, 2020 11:30 A.M.

Bid results

Bid Committee- Dan Anderson, Ashley Valentine, Lacey Moneyham

Also Present- Consultant from CRA Greg Kelley

Recommended award winning bid in bold

**Boyer Construction – \$236,640**

Curts Construction – 341,491

Great Southern Demo-187,000

Pete Slaughter Land Clearing- Incomplete Bid

The bid committee recommended that the Perry Primary Demolition job be awarded to **Boyer Construction**. Great Southern Demo withdrew their bid after being asked to review the bid they submitted. The reason for the withdrawal was their failure to calculate a major expenditure into the final bid number.

APPROVED

DEC 15 2020

By Taylor County  
School Board

# BID TABU



**CLEMONS, RUTHERFORD & ASSOCIATES, INC.**

ARCHITECTS | PLANNERS | INTERIOR DESIGNERS | CONSTRUCTION MANAGERS

2027 Thomasville Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32308

p: 850-385-6153 | f: 850-386-8420 | www.craarchitects.com

PF

CI

BID OPENING TIME : 11:30 am BID OPENING DATE: December 2, 2020 BID OPENING LOCATION : Taylor County School Board Office 318 N Clark, Perry, Florida 32347	PROJECT BUDGET				DESCRIPTION OF ALTERNATES :
BIDDERS	BID BOND	FORM 7068	ADDEN. REC'D.	SUB LIST	BASE BID
Boyer Construction	✓	✓	✓	✓	236,640.00
Curts Construction	✓	✓	✓	✓	341,491.00
Great Southern Demo	✓	✓	✓	✓	187,000.00
Pete Slaughter Land Clearing	✓	✓		✓	226,000.00
Wilks Site Prep					
Young Striping & Seal					

BIDS OPENED BY: Dan Anderson, TCSB, Dan Anderson	REPRESENTING
BIDS TABULATED BY: Ashly Valentine, Ashly Valentine	REPRESENTING
BIDS WITNESSED BY: Larry Monahan, Larry Monahan	REPRESENTING

**NOTE :** Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.53(5), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of pro

# ESTIMATE FORM

PROJECT NAME: **20087- TCSD- Old Perry Primary Demolition**

CLIENT NAME: Taylor County School District

ALTERNATE #1: Price per portable to remove up to six (6) portables

ALTERNATE #2: Remove double portable

ALTERNATE #3: Remove Covered Walkways including sidewalks and all uncovered sidewalks

ALTERNATE #4: Remove asphalt paving parking lots, driveways, and concrete curbs

ALTERNATE #1	ALTERNATE #2	ALTERNATE #3	ALTERNATE #4	REMARKS
6,500.00	13,000.00	15,000.00	22,000.00	120 days
2340.00	4945.00	66976.00	32,286.00	120 days
1,500.00	7200.00	30,000.00	30,000.00	120 days
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	

TCSB

TCSB

TCSB