

BID ON: LAWN CARE SERVICES -LAND MANAGEMENT
BID NO: 21-07
OPENED: APRIL 21, 2021 @ 10:00 AM

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL COST	ANNUAL COST	ANNUAL COST	ANNUAL COST	ANNUAL COST	ANNUAL COST
	Basic Grounds Maintenance consisting of Grass cutting, weed eating, edging and blowing of the following (4) zones.	CHEMPRO	COMPLETE	GET IT DUNN	GULF COAST	JUBILEE	ROTOLO
1	Southwest Zone						
	Burns Middle School	\$15,000.00	\$30,000.00	NO BID	\$17,934.00	\$17,995.20	\$12,148.18
	Hankins Middle School	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	NO BID	\$11,658.00	\$15,925.20	\$13,164.22
	Bryant High School	\$28,980.00	\$28,500.00	NO BID	\$12,552.00	\$21,652.20	\$22,876.54
	Dixon Elementary School	\$6,000.00	\$16,998.00	NO BID	\$8,967.00	\$6,955.20	\$6,221.39
	Alba Middle School	\$15,000.00	\$36,000.00	NO BID	\$14,340.00	\$25,654.20	\$13,363.24
	Total Cost for Southwest Zone	\$79,980.00	\$126,498.00	-	\$65,451.00	\$88,182.00	\$67,773.57
2	Northwest Zone						
	Calcedaever Elementary School	\$15,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$8,070.00	\$12,585.60	\$12,744.42
	McDavid Jones Elementary School	\$19,020.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$17,934.00	\$23,515.20	\$18,411.22
	Allentown Elementary School	\$15,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$12,552.00	\$17,360.40	\$12,790.01
	Lott Middle School	\$9,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$8,967.00	\$9,315.00	\$6,847.74
	Citronelle High School	\$15,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$25,104.00	\$17,332.80	\$12,807.44
	Total Cost for Northwest Zone	\$73,020.00	-	-	\$72,627.00	\$80,109.00	\$63,600.83

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL COST	ANNUAL COST	ANNUAL COST	ANNUAL COST	ANNUAL COST	ANNUAL COST		
		CHEMPRO	COMPLETE	GET IT DUNN	GULF COAST	JUBILEE	ROTOLO		
3	Southeast Zone								
	Dickson Elementary School	\$15,000.00	\$14,000.00	\$16,800.00	\$12,552.00	\$13,496.40	\$10,330.35		
	Craighead Elementary School	\$9,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$14,340.00	\$9,770.40	\$10,056.85		
	Gilliard Elementary School	\$15,000.00	\$30,500.00	\$12,000.00	\$14,340.00	\$16,242.60	\$10,151.96		
	Denton Middle School	\$15,000.00	\$26,000.00	\$19,200.00	\$26,901.00	\$15,276.60	\$9,902.30		
	Davidson High School	\$19,020.00	\$28,000.00	\$19,200.00	\$26,901.00	\$17,015.40	\$17,548.58		
	Total Cost for Southeast Zone	\$73,020.00	\$113,500.00	\$79,200.00	\$95,034.00	\$71,801.40	\$57,990.04		
4	Northeast Zone								
	Vigor High School	\$15,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$12,552.00	\$12,461.40	\$11,267.53		
	Calloway Smith Middle School	\$15,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$19,728.00	\$14,089.80	\$11,601.71		
	North Mobile K-8 School	\$15,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$10,752.00	\$16,242.60	\$15,991.69		
	Chastang-Fournier Middle School	\$19,020.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$17,934.00	\$26,261.40	\$16,205.81		
	Collins-Rhodes Elementary School	\$15,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$8,070.00	\$9,232.20	\$8,636.85		
	Total Cost for Northeast Zone	\$79,020.00	-	-	\$69,036.00	\$78,287.40	\$63,703.59		
OPTION ITEMS									
5	Central Office Campus	\$42,180.00	\$49,449.96	NO BID	\$57,499.92	\$39,312.00	\$43,133.37		
	Basic Grounds Maintenance, Field Maintenance annual bedding mulch, pruning of ornamental trees, shrubbery and ground covers as needed in specifications.								
SUMMARY									
1	Southwest Zone	\$79,980.00	\$5,598.60	\$74,381.40	\$126,498.00	-	\$65,451.00	\$88,182.00	\$67,773.57
2	Northwest Zone	\$73,020.00	\$5,111.40	\$67,908.60	-	-	\$72,627.00	\$80,109.00	\$63,600.83
3	Southeast Zone	\$73,020.00	\$5,111.40	\$67,908.60	\$113,500.00	\$79,200.00	\$95,034.00	\$71,801.40	\$57,990.04
4	Northeast Zone	\$79,020.00	\$5,531.40	\$73,488.60	-	-	\$69,036.00	\$78,287.40	\$63,703.59
5	Central Office Campus	\$42,180.00	\$2,952.60	\$39,227.40	\$49,449.96	-	\$57,499.92	\$39,312.00	\$43,133.37
	TOTAL FOR ALL AREAS	\$347,220.00	\$24,305.40	\$322,914.60			\$359,647.92	\$357,691.80	\$296,201.40

6 Removal of storm damage/debris (Please identify how your company will handle this service and cost of such)

CHEMPRO SERVICES

Time and material basis of \$25.00 per man hour, plus landfill dropoff fee.

*ChemPro is willing to service either: the Central Office campus (alone), or at least two zones, or the entire scope. We are not able to accept an award of only one zone.

*We would prefer an award of the entire scope and are willing to offer a 7% discount to receive the entire scope of work.

COMPLETE MGMT

Storm debris will be cleaned & hauled away @ \$175.00 per cubic yard.

Trees cut down - depends on tree.

GET IT DUNN, LLC

SE ZONE - INITIAL CLEANING

Dickson Elementary	\$1,100.00
Craighead Element.	\$1,000.00
Gilliard Elementary	\$1,500.00
Denton Middle	\$1,100.00
Davidson High	\$1,200.00
	<hr/>
	\$5,900.00

GULF COAST ENV.

\$35.00 per man hour for labor

\$30.00 per CY for hauling & debris disposal

\$45.00 per man hour for operator & handheld equipment (chainsaw, hedge trimmers, etc.)

\$85.00 per man hour for operator & skid steer with grapple bucket.

JUBILEE LANDSCAPE

\$100.00 per hour, plus debris removal fee.

ROTOLO CONSULTANTS

Labor & equipment rates for any extensive storm clean-up:

General Labor - \$35.00/hour, \$52.50/hour for overtime

Driver - \$40.00/hour, \$60.00/hour for overtime

Landscape Foreman - \$45.00/hour, \$67.50/hour for overtime

Equipment Operator - \$45/hour, \$67.50/hour for overtime

Project Superintendent - \$65.00/hour, \$97.50/hour for overtime

Irrigation Tech - \$75.00/hour, \$112.50/hour for overtime

Project Manager - \$75.00/hour, \$112.50/hour for overtime

String Trimmer/Edger/Blower - \$7.50/hour

21" Mower - \$10.00/hour

Zero-Turn Mower - \$17.50/hour

Spray Unit - \$20.00/hour

Mini-Excavator - \$35.00/hour

Chipper - \$30.00/hour

SK 750 Ditch Witch - \$35.00/hour

Skid Steer w/attachments - \$40.00/hour

Ford F750 Dump Truck - \$40.00/hour

Ford F450 Medium Truck - \$35.00/hour

F-Series Medium Truck - \$25.00/hour

1000 Gallon Water Buffalo - \$25.00/hour

Plate Compactor - \$15.00/hour

Sod Cutter - \$15.00/hour

Tiller - \$15.00/hour

AG Tractor - \$40.00/hour

If any materials may be necessary as part of the clean-up effort, RCI will provide those costs at that time for approval.