BID ON: APPLIANCES AS NEEDED UNTIL 7/31/2021
BID NO: 20-57
OPENED: JULY 8§, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

G.E. JBS460DMWW

or approved equal.

DELIVERY TIME
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND/MODEL WARRANTY AFTER RECEIPT
OF P.O.
Electric Washer GE Appliances $403.00 GE GTW465ASNWW 1 Yr Parts & Labor 10 Days ARO
G.E. GTW465ASNWW
or approved equal.
Electric Dryer GE Appliances $407.00 GE GTX22EASKWW 1 Yr Parts & Labor 10 Days ARO
G.E. GTX22EASKWW
or approved equal.
All-in-one Combination Washer/Dryer No Bid Received
Whirlpool WET4027HW
or approved equal.
Chest Freezer. 21.6 cu. ft. GE Appliances $758.00 GE FCM22DJWW 1 Yr Parts & Labor 10 Days ARO
G.E. FCM22DJWW
or approved equal.
Refrigerator/Freezer. 21.2 cu. ft. GE Appliances $584.00 GE GIEI8SGTNRWW 1 Yr Parts & Labor 10 Days ARO
G.E. GIEISGTNRWW
or approved equal.
Dishwasher, Built-In GE Appliances $561.00 GE GDT655SHSS 1 Yr Parts & Labor 10 Days ARO
G.E. GDT635HSJSS
or approved equal.
Electric Range GE Appliances $475.00 GE JBS460DMWW 1 Yr Parts & Labor 10 Days ARO



ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION
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11
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13
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Outlet Hood
G.E. Profile PVX7300SJSS or

approved equal.

Electric Range
G.E. JB860SJSS

or approved equal.

Garbage Disposer
G.E. GFC1020N

or approved equal.

Microwave Oven
G.E. PEB7227DLBB

or approved equal.

Refrigerator. 11.6 cu. ft.
G.E. GPE12FGKWW

or approved equal.

Refrigerator. 14.6 cu. ft.
G.E. GTE16DTNLWW

or approved equal.

Refrigerator, Side-By-Side
G.E. GSE23GGKWW

or approved equal.

Electric Range, Smooth-Top
G.E. JB750DJWW

or approved equal.

BIDDER

GE Appliances

GE Appliances

GE Appliances

GE Appliances

GE Appliances

GE Appliances

GE Appliances

GE Appliances

UNIT COST

$372.00

$864.00

$187.00

$184.00

$656.00

$536.00

$1,194.00

$684.00

BRAND/MODEL

GE Profile PVX7300SJSS

GE JB860SJSS

GE GFC1020N

GE Profile PEB772DLBB

GE GPE12FGKWW

GE GTEI6DTNLWW

GE GSE23GGKWW

GE JB750DJWW

WARRANTY

1 Yr Parts & Labor

1 Yr Parts & Labor

1 Yr Parts & Labor

1 Yr Parts & Labor

1 Yr Parts & Labor

1 Yr Parts & Labor

1 Yr Parts & Labor

1 Yr Parts & Labor

DELIVERY TIME
AFTER RECEIPT

OF P.O.

10 Days ARO

10 Days ARO

10 Days ARO

10 Days ARO

10 Days ARO

10 Days ARO

10 Days ARO

10 Days ARO



ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION
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Freezer, Up-Right

G.E. FUF21DLRWW

or approved equal.

Microwave Oven, Full Size Countertop
G.E. PEB7227DLWW

or approved equal.

Power Cords/Washer Hoses

For item #1

For item #2

For item #3

For item #4

For item #5

For item #6

For item #7

For item #8

GE Appliances

GE Appliances

BIDDER

GE Appliances

GE Appliances

GE Appliances

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

UNIT COST

$683.00

$184.00

OPTIONAL

List price for the power
cord if not supplied

with quoted item

$12.00

$12.00

BRAND/MODEL

GE FUF2IDLRWW

GE Profile PEB7227DLWW

OPTIONAL
List price for the
washer hoses if
not supplied with

quoted item

10.00

WARRANTY

1 Yr Parts & Labor

1 Yr Parts & Labor

DELIVERY TIME
AFTER RECEIPT

OF P.O.

10 Days ARO

10 Days ARO
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Power Cords/Washer Hoses

For item #9

For item #10

For item #11

For item #12

For item #13

For item #14

For item #15

For item #16

For item #17

NOTES:

BIDDER

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

GE Appliances

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

OPTIONAL

List price for the power

cord if not supplied

with quoted item

$12.00

OPTIONAL
List price for the
washer hoses if
not supplied with

quoted item

GE Appliances states on an email that there is a national industry issue with a large backorder situation with freezers.



