

BID ON: MASONRY BLOCKS - AS NEEDED UNTIL NOVEMBER 30, 2021
BID NO: 20-102

Bidder must furnish a written document from a certified testing laboratory showing the equivalent thickness. Tests set by the Southern Building Code. All blocks tested must be in accordance with ASTM C-140-75 and ASTM C-90.

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND/ MODEL	DELIVERY ARO
1	4" Lightweight Masonry Block Partition	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$1.58	Coastal	2-3 Days
2	Solid	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$1.87	Coastal	2-3 Days
3	Half Partition	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$1.52	Coastal	2-3 Days
4	6" Lightweight Masonry Block Partition	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$1.72	Coastal	2-3 Days
5	Solid	Ea.	No Bid Received			
6	Half Partition	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$1.58	Coastal	2-3 Days
7	"U" Lintel	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$1.92	Coastal	2-3 Days
8	8" Lightweight Masonry Block Stretcher - 2 Core	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$1.78	Coastal	2-3 Days
9	Corner - 2 Core	Ea.	No Bid Received			
10	Pier - 2 Core	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$2.07	Coastal	2-3 Days
11	Pier - Single Core	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$2.07	Coastal	2-3 Days
12	Plain End Sash Half	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$1.62	Coastal	2-3 Days
13	Lintel	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$2.07	Coastal	2-3 Days
14	Lintel Right or Left	Ea.	No Bid Received			
15	U-Lintel	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$2.07	Coastal	2-3 Days
16	Half High Pier	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$1.87	Coastal	2-3 Days

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND/ MODEL	DELIVERY ARO
17	Header (Open Bottom)	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$2.12	Coastal	2-3 Days
18	Header (Closed Bottom)	Ea.	No Bid Received			
19	Split Face, 8 X 8 X 16	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$2.65	Coastal	2-3 Days
20	Split Face, return corner, 8 X 8 X 16	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$3.15	Coastal	2-3 Days
21	Split Face, open bottom lintel, 8 X 8 X 16	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$3.15	Coastal	2-3 Days
22	Split Face, solid bottom lintel, 8 X 8 X 16	Ea.	Coastal an Old Castle Co.	\$3.15	Coastal	2-3 Days

VENDOR ADDRESS

#14465
COASTAL AN OLD CASTLE CO.
P.O. BOX 281479
ATLANTA, GA 30384-1479
(251) 443-2040 PHONE
(251) 443-2050 FAX