

BID ON: A-CNP GROCERY & B-CNP SUPPLY
BID NO.: 20-51

Item Number	Specifications	BIDDER	Purchase Unit	Portion Count & Weight	Brand and Code	Price Per Unit
PART A - CNP GROCERY						
1	WATER DISTILLED Pack: 6/1 gal. Distilled water that has been ozonated and filtered to insure quality. Brand: Packer Label, Arlington Springs, Kentwood.	Butler Foods	EACH	1 Gal	Purity 58278	\$1.25
2	WHOLE GRAIN CORN BREAD MIX 6 - 5# pouches/case. Brand: Pioneer 212643 or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	6/5#	Pioneer 212643	\$35.39
3	BEEF RIB PATTIE WITH BBQ SAUCE 100/3 oz. per case. Bulk packed. Fully cooked flame broiled rib shaped beef patty with BBQ sauce. Credits 2 oz. M/MA. Brand: Advance Pierre 3853 or approved equal.	Butler Foods	CASE	100/3 oz.	Adv. Pierre 38538	\$105.00
4	GUMBO BASE, ROUX Contains no meat or seafood. Brand: Olde South Foods, MMI Culinary or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	4/6#	Olde South 30064	\$53.38
5	LIGHT RANCH SAUCE Cup, individual serving, foil top peel back lid, individual container to contain nutritional information, no high fructose corn syrup, less than 75 calories per serving, less than 135 mg of sodium per serving, 0 grams of trans fat, 100-1 oz. (28 grams), or 120 1 oz. servings per case. Brand: Diamond Crystal House Blend 70808, Marzetti's 83985 or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	100/1 oz.	D/Crystal 70808	\$13.60
6	APPLE JUICE 100% Fruit juice, 12/46 oz. cans per case. Brand: Clement Pappas or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	12/46 oz.	Lyons Magnus 151149	\$39.99

Item Number	Specifications	BIDDER	Purchase Unit	Portion Count & Weight	Brand and Code	Price Per Unit
7	WHOLE GRAIN GRITS Whole corn grits. 8/4 lb bags of frozen whole corn grits per case. Must conform to USDA Child Nutrition Program specifications and provide 1 whole grain per 4 oz. serving. Servings per case: 128. Brand: MMI Culinary CN80003 or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	8/4#	King Creole 800031	\$43.98
8	BAKED POTATO SOUP WITH TURKEY BACON Baked potato soup with turkey bacon. 8/4 lb. bags of frozen soup per case. Must conform to USDA Child Nutrition Program specifications and provide 1 oz. MMA and 1/2 c. vegetable per 5 oz. serving. Servings per case: 102. Brand: MMI Culinary CN80006 or approved equal.	Butler Foods	CASE	8/4#	MMI CN80006	\$69.50
FROZEN BREAKFAST & BREADS						
9	2.43 oz. single serving. Mini cinnamon creamy cheese bagels. Whole wheat flour. Bagel filled with cinnamon creamy cheese, individually wrapped thaw and serve packages. 16 grams of whole grain per serving. Case: 72 Brand: Pillsbury Mini Bagels Cinnamon Creamy Cheese 100-18000-38399-0 or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	72/2.43 oz.	Pillsbury G/M 38399	\$36.38
10	2.43 oz. single serving. Mini strawberry creamy cheese bagels. Whole wheat flour. Bagel filled with strawberry creamy cheese, individually wrapped thaw and serve packages. 16 grams of whole grain per serving. Case: 72 Brand: Pillsbury Mini Bagels Strawberry Creamy Cheese 100-18000-38413-3 or approved equal.	Butler Foods	CASE	72/2.43 oz.	Pillsbury 38413	\$42.53
YOGURT						
11	4 oz. serving. Value sized Original blended yogurt. Loose cups. Available in 2 variety packs. No artificial colors or flavors. Gluten free. Case: 48 Brand: Yoplait Original Strawberry, Strawberry-Banana Yogurt 000-70470-17729-8 or approved equal.	Butler Foods	CASE	48/4 oz.	Yoplait 17729	\$24.15
12	4 oz. serving. Value sized Original blended yogurt. Loose cups. Available in 2 variety packs. No artificial colors or flavors. Gluten free. Case: 48 Brand: Yoplait Original Red Raspberry, Harvest Peach Yogurt 000-70470-17728-1 or approved equal.	Butler Foods	CASE	48/4 oz.	Yoplait 17728	\$24.15

Item Number	Specifications	BIDDER	Purchase Unit	Portion Count & Weight	Brand and Code	Price Per Unit
CRACKERS						
13	.92 oz. serving. Whole wheat. Whole grain cereal pieces with a cheddar flavoring. 70% less fat than regular potato chips. Case: 60 Brand: Simply Chex Cheddar Snack Mix 100-16000-31932-2 or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	60/.92 oz.	Chex 31932	\$27.00
14	1.03 oz. serving. Whole wheat. Whole grain cereal pieces with strawberry and yogurt flavoring. 70% less fat than regular potato chips. Case: 60 Brand: Simply Chex Strawberry Yogurt Snack Mix 100-16000-31937-7 or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	60/1.03 oz.	Chex 31937	\$27.51
SMOOTHIES						
15	8/30 oz., Chef ready frozen puree guarantees premium quality and taste. Ready to use product. Brand: Dole 50 Calorie Breakfast Blenderless Smoothies or approved equal. Flavors:					
a.	Mango 10502	Merchants Food	CASE	8/30 oz.	Dole 10502	\$43.13
b.	Peach 27601	Merchants Food	CASE	8/30 oz.	Dole 27601	\$37.12
c.	Strawberry 17139	Merchants Food	CASE	8/30 oz.	Dole 17139	\$37.12
d.	Blackberry 18714	Merchants Food	CASE	8/30 oz.	Dole 18714	\$49.12
PINEAPPLE JUICE						
16	12/46 oz., Natural sweetener and a great source of vitamins. Brand: Dole Pineapple Juice or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	12/46 oz.	Dole 104818	\$31.89
CHEESE BREADSTICK						
17	112/2 oz., Premium quality cheese breadsticks, fresh baked with 51% WG rich flour and filled with mozzarella cheese. Brand: Wild Mike's or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	112/2 oz.	Wild Mike's 11001	\$63.80
CHEESE BITES						
18	240/1 oz., Premium quality cheese bites, fresh baked with 51% WG rich flour and filled with mozzarella cheese. Brand: Wild Mike's or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	240/1 oz.	Wild Mike's 11003	\$70.58

Item Number	Specifications	BIDDER	Purchase Unit	Portion Count & Weight	Brand and Code	Price Per Unit
FRUIT BOWLS						
19	4 oz. serving. Fruit in 100% fruit juice. No high fructose corn syrup. All natural fruit. Shelf stable, no refrigeration required. Case: 36/4 oz. Brand: Dole Fruit Bowls or approved equal. Flavors:					
	a. Cherry Mixed Fruit 100-38900-02062-7	Merchants Food	CASE	36-4 oz.	Dole 02062	\$20.48
	b. Mixed Fruit 100-38900-03065-7	Merchants Food	CASE	36-4 oz.	Dole 03065	\$20.48
	c. Tropical Fruit 100-38900-03048-0	Merchants Food	CASE	36-4 oz.	Dole 03048	\$20.48
	d. Diced Peaches 100-38900-03073-2	Merchants Food	CASE	36-4 oz.	Dole 03073	\$20.48
	e. Mandarin Oranges 100-38900-04208-7	Merchants Food	CASE	36-4 oz.	Dole 04208	\$21.15
	f. Pineapple Tidbits 100-38900-00419-1	Merchants Food	CASE	36-4 oz.	Dole 00419	\$20.48
SLUSHIES						
20	4 oz. serving. 100% juice slush in a pouch. Preservative free, no sugar added, natural flavors and colors. Gluten and allergen free. Shelf stable up to 12 months. 60 calories. Freeze, squeeze, rip and sip. Case 60. Brand: Rips 100% Juice Slush by Cool Tropics or approved equal. Flavors:					
	a. Kiwi Strawberry 876017002456	Butler Foods	CASE	60/4 oz.	Rips 12002	\$25.86
	b. Dragon Punch 876017002470	Butler Foods	CASE	60/4 oz.	Rips 12004	\$25.86
	c. Blue Raspberry 876017003118	Butler Foods	CASE	60/4 oz.	Rips 13001	\$25.86
	d. Sour Apple 876017003101	Butler Foods	CASE	60/4 oz.	Rips 13006	\$25.86
	e. Cherry Limeade 876017003125	Butler Foods	CASE	60/4 oz.	Rips 13007	\$25.86

Item Number	Specifications	BIDDER	Purchase Unit	Portion Count & Weight	Brand and Code	Price Per Unit
21	4 oz. serving. 100% juice slush. Freeze, squeeze and savor the flavor. Preservative free, no added sugar, natural flavors and colors. Gluten and allergen free. 80 calories. Shelf stable up to 12 months. Case 60. Brand: Cool Tropics or approved equal. Flavors: a. Tropical Trio (Mango, Guava & Orange flavor) 876017003378	Butler Foods	CASE	60/4 oz.	Cool Tropics 16001	\$29.21
BREAKFAST PIZZA						
22	Individually wrapped breakfast pizza, 51% WG crust with a red sauce and NO PORK. The topping is made of beef sausage. Case 160/2.79 oz. Brand: Wild Mike's #90502 or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	160/2.79 oz.	Wild Mike's 90502	\$99.00
ORANGE MEDLEY JUICE						
23	4.23 oz. serving. Meets 1/2 cup of red/orange vegetable requirement. A medley of flavors (sweet potatoes, carrots and orange juice). Great for bag lunches. Case 40/4.23 oz. Brand: Juicy Juice Orange Medley or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	40/4.23 oz.	Juicy Juice 970066	\$7.74
JERKY						
24	Bold flavor and tons of protein, 80 calories. Meets smart snack requirements. Case 48/.85 oz. Brand: Jack Links Beef Jerky or approved equal. Flavors: a. Original Beef Jerky #660189 b. Teriyaki Beef Jerky #659982 c. Peppered Beef Jerky #659981	Merchants Food	CASE	48/.85	Jack Links 660189	\$67.50
		Merchants Food	CASE	48/.85	Jack Links 659982	\$67.50
		Merchants Food	CASE	48/.85	Jack Links 659981	\$67.50
JAMBALAYA BASE						
25	Creole jambalaya base. Case 8/4 lbs. Brand: MMI #CN80019 or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	8/4#	King Creole 580019	\$67.83

Item Number	Specifications	BIDDER	Purchase Unit	Portion Count & Weight	Brand and Code	Price Per Unit
	SHRIMP POPPERS					
26	Packed with real, minced shrimp and full of flavor. 51% WG coating & 30% less sodium than the original breaded shrimp poppers. Case 5/2 lbs. Brand: SeaPac #47039 or approved equal.	Merchants Food	CASE	2/5#	SeaPac 47039	\$40.45
	COLD BREW COFFEE					
27	Java house authentic cold brew coffee, smooth, 100% Arabica coffee beans. Case 12/10 oz. Brand: Heartland or approved equal. Flavors:					
	a. Salted Caramel Lightly Sweet RTD	Merchants Food	CASE	12/10 oz.	Heartland FCH09060	\$27.50
	b. Vanilla Lightly Sweet RTD	Merchants Food	CASE	12/10 oz.	Heartland FCB09060	\$27.50
	PIZZA					
28	Individually wrapped, pepperoni cheesy bottom pizza, 51% WG crust. Case 90/5.49 oz. Brand: Wild Mike's #90500 or approved equal.	Butler Foods	CASE	90/5.5 oz.	Wild Mike's 90500	\$92.39
29	DUTCH WAFFLE 51% Whole grain, 5" .2 Servings of grains. Shelf life up to one year when stored properly. 300 Calories per serving. Case count: 48 Brand: Dutch Waffle 4521 by J&J Snack Foods or approved equal.	Butler Foods	CASE	48 ct.	Dutch Waffle J&J 4521	\$29.58

Item Number	Specifications	BIDDER	Purchase Unit	Portion Count & Weight	Brand and Code	Price Per Unit
PART B-CNP SUPPLY						
DECARBONIZER						
30	Liquid concentrate, safe for aluminum and other soft metals. Product can be used in food service area and on cooking utensils to lift carbon grease buildup without scrubbing. Product must have 0 on all MSDS (Flammability, Health and Reactivity) and be safe for sewers and storm drains. Material Safety Data Sheet is required with bid proposal. The dilution ratio for product must be submitted with bid. Bidder must submit a written breakdown based on the ratio submitted using their product to show the actual cost per ounce. Pack: 4/1 gallon case. Brand: Duo-Zyme 555 by United Labs or approved equal.	No Bid Received	4/1 CASE			
FOOD PACKAGING SYSTEM						
31	Bagging System to include heavy duty tape sealer and bag stand. Custom rubber feet. Brand: Ekon-O-Pac EPAC4 or approved equal.	No Bid Received	EACH			
	Supplies to be used with food packaging system:					
a.	Cold sealing tape - colors: red	No Bid Received	EACH			
b.	Cold sealing tape - colors: blue	No Bid Received	EACH			
c.	Cold sealing tape - colors: green	No Bid Received	EACH			
d.	Cold sealing tape - colors: yellow	No Bid Received	EACH			
e.	Cold sealing tape - colors: orange	No Bid Received	EACH			
f.	Hot sealing tape	No Bid Received	EACH			
g.	CD78NV - 7 X 8 bags, 5000 per case	No Bid Received	CASE			
h.	MD78V - 7 X 8 bags, 5000 per case	No Bid Received	CASE			
i.	HB78V - Vented 7 X 9, 5000 per case	No Bid Received	CASE			
j.	HB78MP - Mult-vented 7 X 9, 5000 per case	No Bid Received	CASE			
k.	BB91GNV - 9 X 11, 3000 per case	No Bid Received	CASE			
	Brand: Ekon-O-Pac Food Packaging System or approved equal.					

Item Number	Specifications	BIDDER	Purchase Unit	Portion Count & Weight	Brand and Code	Price Per Unit
----------------	----------------	--------	------------------	------------------------------	----------------------	----------------------

VENDOR ADDRESSES

#5529
MERCHANTS FOOD SERVICE
 1100 EDWARDS STREET
 HATTIESBURG, MS 39401
 (601) 584-4044 PHONE

#116253
BUTLER FOODS
 3311 HIGHWAY 29 SOUTH
 CANTONMENT, FL 32533
 (850) 478-2363 PHONE
 (850) 478-4181 FAX