
BID ON:  BUILDING MATERIALS - AS NEEDED FROM 12/1/19 - 1/31/20 - MAINT. DEPT.
BID NO: 19-98
OPENED: OCTOBER 24, 2019 @ 2:00 PM

ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

PLYWOOD

1 4' x 8' x 1/4" A.B. Birch plywood per sheet Mobile Lumber $99.00 C3 Grade 2 Wks

2 4' x 8' x 3/4" A.B. Birch plywood, 9 ply per sheet Mobile Lumber $109.00 C3 Grade 2 Wks

3 4' x 8' x 1/2" A.C.                                                            per sheet Mobile Lumber $35.50 15/32" Radiata Pine In Stock

4 4' x 8' x 3/4" A.B. Fir plywood per sheet Mobile Lumber $109.00 23/32" Various 2 Wks

5 4' x 8' x 1/4" A.C. Fir plywood ext. per sheet No Bid Received

6 4' x 8' x 3/8" A.C. Fir plywood ext. per sheet Mobile Lumber $34.45 11/32" Radiata Pine In Stock

7 4' x 8' x 1/2" A.C. Fir plywood ext. per sheet Mobile Lumber $35.50 15/32" Radiata Pine In Stock

8 4' x 8' x 3/4" A.C. Fir plywood ext. per sheet Mobile Lumber $55.90 23/32" Radiata Pine In Stock

9 4' x 8' x 1/2" CDX plywood per sheet Mobile Lumber $18.99 15/32" Various In Stock

10 4' x 8' x 3/8" CDX plywood per sheet Mobile Lumber $16.50 11/32" Various In Stock

11 4' x 8' x 3/4" CDX plywood per sheet Mobile Lumber $24.99 23/32" Various In Stock

12 4' x 8' x 1/2" B. C. Pine plywood (4 ply) per sheet Mobile Lumber $26.99 15/32" Various In Stock

13 4' x 8' x 3/4" B. C. Pine plywood (5 ply) per sheet Mobile Lumber $35.75 23/32" Various In Stock

14 4' x 8' x 1/2" B.C. treated plywood per sheet Mobile Lumber $43.90 15/32" Various In Stock

15 4' x 8' x 1/4" B.C. treated plywood per sheet No Bid Received

16 4' x 8' x 3/8" B.C. treated plywood per sheet No Bid Received



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

17 4' x 8' x 3/4" B.C. treated plywood per sheet Mobile Lumber $46.95 23/32" Various In Stock

18 4' x 8' x 1/4" Luan plywood per sheet Mobile Lumber $16.99 Various In Stock

19 4' x 8' x 1/2" Luan plywood per sheet Mobile Lumber $42.65 Various In Stock

20 3/4" x 4' x 8' Tongue and Groove Plywood per sheet Mobile Lumber $34.95 23/32" Various In Stock

21 4' x 8' x 3/4" Particle Board per sheet Mobile Lumber $37.50 MDF In Stock

22 4' x 8' x 1 /8" Masonite Tempered per sheet No Bid Received

23 4' x 8' x 1/4" Masonite Tempered per sheet No Bid Received

24 4' x 8' x 1/4" GP Waffer Board per sheet No Bid Received

25 4' x 8' x 3/4" GP Waffer Board per sheet Mobile Lumber $29.99 23/32" T&G Various In Stock

26 4' x 8' x 1/2" GP Waffer Board per sheet Mobile Lumber $10.99 7/16" Various In Stock

27 5/8" x 4' x 8' RB&B Exterior Pine Siding per sheet Mobile Lumber $39.96 19/32" Deco In Stock

28 4' x 8' x 1/4" #1 Grade Paneling, Lt. Birch per sheet Mobile Lumber $46.00 Various 2 Wks

29 Stuccato Board, Primed, 4' x 8' x 7/16" per each Mobile Lumber $38.75 5/32" Various In Stock

30 4' x 8' x 5/8" Exterior Siding, Treated Pine, Reverse per sheet Mobile Lumber $56.96 19/32" Various In Stock
Board & Batten

LUMBER

31 1" x 12" Fir; Random Lengths, 12' or longer per lin. foot No Bid Received
C-Grade

32 5/4" x 12" Fir, Random Lengths, 8' or longer, per lin. foot No Bid Received
C-Grade

33 1" x 4" Fir; S4S WC Select or Better per lin. foot No Bid Received
Random Lengths, 8' or longer



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

34 2" x 4" Fir; S4S-Random Lengths, 8' or longer per lin. foot No Bid Received

35 2" x 6" Fir; S4S-Random Lengths, 8' or longer per lin. foot No Bid Received

36 1" x 6" Fir; S4S-Random Lengths, 12' or longer per lin. foot No Bid Received
C-Grade

37 5/4 x 4" Fir; S4S-Random Lengths, 12' or longer per lin. foot No Bid Received
C-Grade

38 1" x 2" Fir; S4S-Random Lengths, 12' or longer per lin. foot No Bid Received
C-Grade

39 1" x 8" Redwood; S4S - Random Lengths, 12' per lin. foot No Bid Received
or longer

40 5/4 x 10" Fir; S4S-Random Lengths, 12' or longer per lin. foot No Bid Received
C-Grade

41 1" x 8" S4S Fir; WC Select or Better; Random per lin. foot No Bid Received
Lengths, 12' or longer

42 1" x 12" Ponderosa Pine Shelving; C Grade per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $10.25 Various 2 Wks
Random lengths 12' or longer per L.F.

43 4" x 4" S4S Pine Treated 8' per piece Mobile Lumber $11.75 Various In Stock

44 4" x 4" S4S Pine Treated 10' per piece Mobile Lumber $12.85 Various In Stock

45 4" x 4" S4S Pine Treated 12' per piece Mobile Lumber $15.99 Various In Stock

46 4" x 4" S4S Pine Treated 16' per piece Mobile Lumber $20.25 Various In Stock

47 2" x 12" S4S Pine Treated 8' per piece Mobile Lumber $13.25 Various In Stock

48 2" x 12" S4S Pine Treated 10' per piece Mobile Lumber $20.40 Various In Stock

49 2" x 12" S4S Pine Treated 12' per piece Mobile Lumber $25.81 Various In Stock



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

50 2" x 12" S4S Pine Treated 14' per piece Mobile Lumber $30.70 Various In Stock
 

51 2" x 12" S4S Pine Treated 16' per piece Mobile Lumber $31.95 Various In Stock

52 2" x 12" S4S Pine Treated 20' per piece Mobile Lumber $54.90 Various In Stock

53 6" x 6" S4S Pine Treated 8' per piece Mobile Lumber $23.90 Various In Stock

54 6" x 6" S4S Pine Treated 10' per piece Mobile Lumber $29.90 Various In Stock

55 6" x 6" S4S Pine Treated 12' per piece Mobile Lumber $35.25 Various In Stock

56 6" x 6" S4S Pine Treated 16' per piece Mobile Lumber $45.50 Various In Stock

57 8" x 8" S4S Pine Treated 8' per piece No Bid Received

58 8" x 8" S4S Pine Treated 10' per piece No Bid Received

59 8" x 8" S4S Pine Treated 12' per piece No Bid Received

60 2" x 10" S4S Pine Treated 10' per piece Mobile Lumber $12.99 Various In Stock

61 2" x 10" S4S Pine Treated 12' per piece Mobile Lumber $15.40 Various In Stock

62 2" x 10" S4S Pine Treated 14' per piece Mobile Lumber $17.99 Various In Stock

63 2" x 8" S4S Pine Treated 10' per piece Mobile Lumber $11.50 Various In Stock

64 2" x 8" S4S Pine Treated 12' per piece Mobile Lumber $13.96 Various In Stock

65 2" x 8" S4S Pine Treated 14' per piece Mobile Lumber $16.25 Various In Stock

66 2" x 8" S4S Pine Treated 16' per piece Mobile Lumber $18.75 Various In Stock

67 2" x 8" S4S Pine Treated 20' per piece Mobile Lumber $23.25 Various In Stock

68 2" x 6" S4S Pine Treated 8' per piece Mobile Lumber $7.35 Various In Stock



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

69 2" x 6" S4S Pine Treated 10' per piece Mobile Lumber $9.90 Various In Stock

70 2" x 6" S4S Pine Treated 12' per piece Mobile Lumber $11.99 Various In Stock

71 2" x 6" S4S Pine Treated 14' per piece Mobile Lumber $13.99 Various In Stock

72 2" x 4" S4S Pine Treated 8' per piece Mobile Lumber $5.75 Various In Stock

73 2" x 4" S4S Pine Treated 10' per piece Mobile Lumber $7.40 Various In Stock

74 2" x 4" S4S Pine Treated 12' per piece Mobile Lumber $8.65 Various In Stock

75 2" x 4" S4S Pine Treated 14' per piece Mobile Lumber $10.35 Various In Stock

76 2" x 4" S4S Pine Treated 16' per piece Mobile Lumber $12.45 Various In Stock

77 2" x 4" S4S Pine Treated 20' per piece No Bid Received

78 2" x 4" Pine #2 - 8' per piece Mobile Lumber $3.60 Various In Stock

79 2" x 4" Pine #2 - 10' per piece Mobile Lumber $4.60 Various In Stock

80 2" x 4" Pine #2 - 12' per piece Mobile Lumber $5.75 Various In Stock

81 2" x 4" Pine #2 - 14' per piece Mobile Lumber $6.65 Various In Stock

82 2" x 4" Pine #2 - 16' per piece Mobile Lumber $7.99 Various In Stock

83 2" x 6" Pine #2 - 8' per piece Mobile Lumber $4.20 Various In Stock

84 2" x 6" Pine #2 - 10' per piece Mobile Lumber $5.85 Various In Stock

85 2" x 6" Pine #2 - 12' per piece Mobile Lumber $7.30 Various In Stock

86 2" x 6" Pine #2 - 14' per piece Mobile Lumber $8.10 Various In Stock

87 2" x 6" Pine #2 - 16' per piece Mobile Lumber $9.20 Various In Stock



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

88 2" x 8" Pine #2 - 8' per piece Mobile Lumber $5.70 Various In Stock

89 2" x 8" Pine #2 - 10' per piece Mobile Lumber $7.75 Various In Stock

90 2" x 8" Pine #2 - 12' per piece Mobile Lumber $8.95 Various In Stock

91 2" x 8" Pine #2 - 14' per piece Mobile Lumber $10.40 Various In Stock

92 2" x 8" Pine #2 - 16' per piece Mobile Lumber $11.60 Various In Stock

93 1" x 4" Pine Treated Random Lengths, 12' or longer per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.59 Various In Stock

94 1" x 6" Pine Treated Random Lengths, 12' or longer per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.89 Various In Stock

95 1" x 8" Pine Treated Random Lengths, 12' or longer per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.99 Various In Stock

96 1" x 4" Pine #2 Random Lengths 12' or longer per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.43 Various In Stock

97 1" x 6" Pine #2 Random Lengths 12' or longer per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.89 Various In Stock

98 1" x 6" Pine T&G Random Lengths 12' or longer per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.98 Various In Stock

99 2" x 4" S4S Lodge Pole Stud - 8' per piece Mobile Lumber $3.99 Stud Grade Various In Stock

100 2" x 4" Lodge Pole Stud - 12' per piece Mobile Lumber $6.75 Stud Grade Various In Stock

101 3/4" Basswood Random Lengths & Widths 8' per bd. ft. Mobile Lumber $3.30 Stud Grade Various In Stock
or longer

102 5/4" x 6" x 10' pressure treated pine. ea Mobile Lumber $7.40 Stud Grade Various In Stock

103 5/4" x 6" x 12' pressure treated pine. ea Mobile Lumber $8.80 Stud Grade Various In Stock

104 5/4" x 6" x 14' pressure treated pine. ea Mobile Lumber $9.45 Stud Grade Various In Stock

105 5/4" x 6" x 16' pressure treated pine. ea Mobile Lumber $11.55 Stud Grade Various In Stock



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

DRYWALL PRODUCTS

106 4' x 8' x 1/2" Sheetrock per sheet Interior Exterior $8.00 NG 4812UL Stocked

107 4' x 12' x 1/2" Sheetrock per sheet Interior Exterior $12.00 NG 41212UL Stocked

108 4' x 8' x 1/2" Moisture Resistant Sheetrock per sheet Interior Exterior $11.20 NG 4812XP Stocked

109 Corner Bead, 10' x 1-1/4" per each Interior Exterior $1.55 CB10 Stocked

110 Joint Compound, 5 gal. bucket, USG or per each Interior Exterior $12.50 NG GBJTCOMPHV Stocked
approved equal

111 Dry Wall Joint Tape, 250' rolls per roll Interior Exterior $1.65 NG Jtape Stocked

112 5/8" x 4' x 8' Fire Resistant Gypsum Panel, per sheet Interior Exterior $11.84 NG 4858XP Stocked
USG W/R or approved equal

DOORS

113 Ext. Door Unit, 1-3/4" x 3068 Swing O/S per each Mobile Lumber $375.00 Various 3 Wks
Solid Core, Birch w/Sill & Threshold
w/one 4" x 24" light

114 Ext. Door Unit, 1-3/4" x 3068 Solid Core, per each Mobile Lumber $375.00 Various 3 Wks
Flush, Birch, Clear Jamb, Without Sill and
Threshold

115 Ext. Door Unit, 1-3/4" x 2868 Solid Core, per each Mobile Lumber $375.00 Various 3 Wks
Flush, Birch, Clear Jamb, Without Sill and
Threshold

116 Ext. Door Unit, 1-3/4" x 2668 Solid Core, per each Mobile Lumber $375.00 Various 3 Wks
Flush, Birch, Clear Jamb, Without Sill and
Threshold



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

117 Ext. Door Unit, 1-3/4" x 3068, Metal Door per each Mobile Lumber $390.00 Various 3 Wks
With Wood Frame, 5" Jamb, With 4" x 20"
Lite, Outside Swing, Sill and Threshold

118 Ext. Door Only, Solid Core, Flush, Birch, per each Mobile Lumber $185.00 Various 3 Wks
1-3/4" x 3070

119 Ext. Door Only, Solid Core, Flush, Birch, per each Mobile Lumber $185.00 Various 3 Wks
. 1-3/4" x 3068

120 Ext. Door Only, Solid Core, Flush, Birch, per each Mobile Lumber $185.00 Various 3 Wks
1-3/4" x 2868

121 Ext. Door Only, Solid Core, Flush, Birch, per each Mobile Lumber $185.00 Various 3 Wks
1-3/4" x 2668

122 Int. Door Only, Solid Core, 1-3/8" x 3068 per each Mobile Lumber $124.00 Various 3 Wks

123 Int. Door Unit, Flush, Luan, 1-3/8" x 3068 per each Mobile Lumber $139.00 Various 3 Wks
Tear Drop Trim

124 Int. Door Only, Birch Six Panel Colonial, per each Mobile Lumber $390.00 Various 3 Wks
1-3/8" x 3070. Barnett Millworks 2130

125 Int. Door Unit, Birch Six Panel Colonial, per each Mobile Lumber $390.00 Various 3 Wks
1-3/8" x 3068, Standard Jamb, Left Hand or
Right Hand. No Bore. Barnett Millworks 2130

126 Int. Door Unit, 1 3/8" x 1650 With Tear per each Mobile Lumber $199.00 Various 3 Wks
Drop Trim

MOULDING

127 1/4 Round Moulding, 3/4" - Random Lengths, 12' or per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.59 Various In Stock
longer

128 3-1/2" Base Moulding - Random Lengths, 12' per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.99 Various In Stock
or longer



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

129 7/16" x 11/16" Shoe Moulding-Random Lengths, per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.38 Various In Stock
12' or longer

130 1-5/8" Bed Moulding - Random Lengths, 12' per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.99 Various In Stock
or longer

131 1-3/8" x 2-1/2" x 16' Fir Drip, Solid, per piece Mobile Lumber $17.75 Various 2 Wks
Clear, NO FINGER JOINT

132 1-1/16" x 2" x 16' Fir Brick Molding, per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $2.85 Various 2 Wks
Solid, Clear, NO FINGER JOINT

133 1-1/16" x 5-1/4" x 16' Flat Stool per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $2.75 Various In Stock

134 3/4" x 3/4" x 8' Inside Corner per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.99 Various In Stock

135 1-1/16" x 1-1/16" Outside Corner per lin. foot Mobile Lumber $0.99 Various In Stock

INSULATION

136 Fiberglass Insulation, 15" x 3-1/2", R-11 per sq. foot Interior Exterior $0.22 CertainTeed 990215 Stocked
faced, 88.12 sq. feet per roll

137 Fiberglass Insulation, 15" x 6", R-19 per sq. foot Interior Exterior $0.33 CertainTeed 990985 Stocked
faced, 48.96 sq. feet per roll

138 Fiberglass Insulation, 23" x 3-1/2", R-11 per sq. foot Interior Exterior $0.22 CertainTeed 990955 Stocked
faced, 135.5 sq. feet per roll

139 Fiberglass Insulation, 23"x48"x6", R-19 per sq. foot Interior Exterior $0.33 CertainTeed 990985 Stocked
faced, baged. 

140 1/2" x 4' x 8' Aluminum Tuff-R-Board per sheet No Bid Received



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

CONCRETE PRODUCTS

141 Structo Lite Plaster, 80# Bag per each No Bid Received

142 Finish Lime, 50# Bag per each No Bid Received

143 Gauging Plaster, 100# Bag per each No Bid Received

144 Moulding Plaster, 100# Bag per each No Bid Received

145 Retarter, 5# Bag per each No Bid Received

146 Retarter, 24 oz. Bag per each No Bid Received

147 Ready Mix Concrete, 80# Bag per each Mobile Lumber $5.20 Various In Stock

148 Cement, 94# Bag, Ideal or approved equal per each Mobile Lumber $13.65 Holcim In Stock

149 Masonry Mix, 70# Bag, Ideal or approved equal. per each Mobile Lumber $10.45 Holcim Type N In Stock

150 Wire Lath (Regular), 27" x 93" Sheets per each No Bid Received

151 Rib Lath, 27" x 93" x 3/8" Rib (Painted) per bundle No Bid Received
10 pieces per bundle

ROOFING PRODUCTS

152 Roofing Cement, 5 Gallon Bucket per each Mobile Lumber $49.95 Various In Stock

153 Cove Rubber Base, 4",  All Colors per piece No Bid Received

154 Cove Rubber Cement, 1 Gallon Buckets per each No Bid Received

155 Roll Roofing, 90#, White per roll No Bid Received

156 Roll Roofing, Mineral Surface, Double Coverage, per roll No Bid Received
White



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

157 Roofing Felt, 15# per roll Mobile Lumber $15.95 Various In Stock

158 Roofing Felt, 30# per roll Mobile Lumber $15.95 Various In Stock

159 Roofing Nails, 7/8", 50# box per box Mobile Lumber $54.00 1" Various In Stock

160 Roof Shingles, Fiberglass, Approx. 225# per square Mobile Lumber $76.75 O/C Sup. 25 Yr In Stock
All Colors

161 Roof Metal Eve Strip, Type D, 250' per box per box Mobile Lumber $179.00 Galv In Stock

162 8' Metal Louver, 3/12 Pitch per each No Bid Received

163 Dimensional premium laminated sq. No Bid Received
shingle.  25 year warranty.
Color to be chosen by owner.
Must carry U.L. Class A and wind
resistant lable.  Meet ASTM
specifications:  D3018-82 Type 1,
D3161-81 Type 1, E108-83.
Elk Corporation, Prestique II; GAF,
Woodline or approved equal.

164 Hip and Ridge shingles. bx No Bid Received
Color to be chosen by owner.
Elk Corporation, Elk Z Ridge,
GAF Timbertex or approved equal.
100 Lin. Ft. per box.

165 Elastomeric White Roof Coating, ea Mobile Lumber $196.00 Henry 2 Wks
pro grade, 5/gallon container.
Henry #HE687 NO SUBSTITUTE.

166 Fibered Roof Coating, ea Mobile Lumber $49.95 Various In Stock
5 gallon container.
Gardner or approved equal.



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

WINDOWS

Aluminum windows, self mulling, two heavy die cast
cam locks at meeting rail, automatic pre-tensioned
spiral balances, continuous sash lift roll, interior
glazing beads, single glazed, pre-drilled installation
holes provided in nailing fin, fully weatherstripped
for air tight seal, nailing fin corner radiused for
protection, must pass forced-entry resistance
specifications, white or natural aluminum finish,
no screen.

167 Windows, Aluminum, Single Hung, 36" x 52" per each No Bid Received
6/6 panes

168 Aluminum Windows, Pre-Hung, Single-Hung per each No Bid Received
3050, 6/6 Panes, Snap-in Grids Not Acceptable,
Keller SH-71 Series or approved equal

169 2/2 lite, for masonry block installation; per each No Bid Received
Craft Series 90; or approved equal.

170 2/2 lite, for frame installation; per each No Bid Received
Craft Series 91; or approved equal.

171 6/6 Colonial lite, for masonry block installation; per each No Bid Received
Craft Series 90; or approved equal.

172 6/6 Colonial lite, for frame installation, per each No Bid Received
Craft Series 91; or approved equal.

TRUSSES

173 Trusses, 24' span, 3/12 pitch, 10" overhang per each No Bid Received
constructed of 2" x 4"

174 End Trusses, 24' span, 3/12 pitch, 10" overhang per each No Bid Received
constructed of 2" x 4"



ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND DELIVERY

ADHESIVES

175 Construction 10.2 Nail Pro Panel Adhesive ea. Mobile Lumber $4.29 DIB In Stock
OSI Sealants #76-872-10.5; or approved equal.

176 Adhesive, Construction & Remodeling, heavy ea. Mobile Lumber $4.79 Macco In Stock
duty (Exterior & Interior)
MACCO LN-901, NO SUBSTITUTE.

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

177 4' x 8' Formica Counter Topping, All Colors per sheet No Bid Received

178 4' x 10' Formica Counter Topping, All Colors per sheet No Bid Received

179 Hurricane Straps per each Mobile Lumber $0.95 Simpson In Stock

180 Sealant, Polyurethane, Elastomeric, ea No Bid Received
Gun-Grade, one-part, 10.1 oz/cartridge,
various colors.
Sonneborn #NP1, Sikaflex 1A.
No Substitute.

181 Sheetrock Tape, Fiberglass, Self Adhesive, ea Interior Exterior $4.49 Quick Tape Stocked
mesh, 300 ft roll. QKTP300
Quicktape 300 or approved equal.

182 Cement Board, 4' x 8' x 1/2", ea Interior Exterior $24.80 NG PB4812 Stocked
Durock, Permabase or approved equal.

183 Roofing Modified Membrane, Roll, 32.56' Length ea No Bid Received
GAF Rubberoid Mop Granule or approved equal.

184 Base Sheet for Roofing Modified Membrane, Roll ea No Bid Received
GAFGLAS #75 Base Sheet or approved equal.

185 Cold Adhesive for Modified Roofing, 5 gallon ea No Bid Received
Karnak #66AF Brush-Grade or approved equal.
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186 Cold Adhesive for Modified Roofing, 5 gallon, ea No Bid Received
Karnak #66AF Trowel-Grade or approved equal.

187 Sustainable Roofing and Waterproofing Coating ea No Bid Received
Hydro Stop Perminum Coat, No Substititues.

188 Fabric, heat set, non-woven 100% polyester,
compatible with the roofing and waterproofing coating
listed for number 187. Bidder must state quantity 
in package. Sizes are:

a 6" wide x 300' long fabric roll roll No Bid Received
b 12" wide x 300' long fabric roll roll No Bid Received
c 40" wide x 336' long fabric roll roll No Bid Received

Quest Premium Coat Fabric , No Substitutes.

189 Treated Exterior Composite Trim, UL listed, SCS 
certified, moisture resistant ASTM D1037, rot 
resistant AWPA E16, termite resistant AWPA E7.
MiraTEC Trim or approved equal.

a 2" x 16' (3/4" actual thickness) ea Mobile Lumber $8.99 MiraTec 3 Days
b 3" x 16' (3/4" actual thickness) ea Mobile Lumber $9.99 MiraTec Stock
c 4" x 16' (3/4" actual thickness) ea Mobile Lumber $13.45 MiraTec Stock
d 5" x 16' (3/4" actual thickness) ea Mobile Lumber $19.10 MiraTec 3 Days
e 6" x 16' (3/4" actual thickness) ea Mobile Lumber $20.40 MiraTec Stock
f 8" x 16' (3/4" actual thickness) ea Mobile Lumber $26.35 MiraTec Stock
g 10" x 16' (3/4" actual thickness) ea Mobile Lumber $32.40 MiraTec Stock
h 12" x 16' (3/4" actual thickness) ea Mobile Lumber $39.19 MiraTec Stock
i 16" x 16' (3/4" actual thickness) ea Mobile Lumber $49.99 MiraTec 3 Days


