

**BID ON: SMALL CAFETERIA SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENT - AS NEEDED UNTIL 12/31/21**  
**BID NO: 20-116**

<b>ITEM #</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>UNIT</b>	<b>BIDDER</b>	<b>UNIT COST</b>	<b>BRAND &amp; MODEL</b>	<b>DELIVERY</b>
1	Aprons					
	A. Black	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.84	Winco BA-PBK	30 Days
	B. Red	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.84	Winco BA-PRD	30 Days
	C. White	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.84	Winco BA-PWH	30 Days
2	Bars, Adaptor for Food Service Pans					
	A. 12 inch bar	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$3.75	75012 Vollrath	3-4 Wks
	B. 20 inch bar	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$5.85	75020 Vollrath	3-4 Wks
3	Brushes, Dish Machine/Kettle, Fryer					
	A. 28" Dish Machine Brush	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.55	Winco BR-28	30 Days
	B. 26" Kettle Valve Brush	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.70	Winco BR-25	30 Days
	C. 24" Fryer Brush	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$37.06	Carlisle 4011205	30 Days
	D. Dishwasher spray arm brush	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$4.65	Carlisle 4002800	30 Days
4	Brushes, Pastry					
	A. 3" wide brush	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$4.95	40392 Carlisle	3-4 Wks
	B. 4" wide brush	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$5.25	40393 Carlisle	3-4 Wks
	C. 3" wide brush with hook molded into handle	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$4.75	40402 Carlisle	3-4 Wks
5	Brushes, Utility 8"	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$8.50	40542 Carlisle	3-4 Wks
6	Bucket, Utility Pail					
	A. 10 qt., gray	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$10.45	Rubbermaid FG296300GRA	30 Days
	B. 14 qt., gray	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$16.05	Rubbermaid FG261400GRA	30 Days

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
7	Pail, Sanitizing & Cleaning, 6 qt. A. Red sanitizing pail, 6 qt	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$4.03	Stanton SB6QRD	30 Days ARO
	B. Green cleaning pail, 6 qt	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$4.03	Stanton CB6QGR	30 Days ARO
8	Pot Holder	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$3.50	803PG San Mar	3-4 Wks
9a	Manual Can Opener - Model U-12S	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$219.93	Edlund U-12S	30 Days
9b	Replacement Knife Blade Kit	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$55.25 ea. 331.51/6 pk	Edlund KT1415	30 Days
10	Cart, Mobile, Molded Plastic 19" x 39" x 33" high	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$212.95	Rubbermaid FG450088Beig	30 Days
11	Cart, Mobile, Platform Truck A. 24" x 36"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$517.85	Rubbermaid FG440600Bla	30 Days
	B. 24" x 48"	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$550.00	4441 RM	3-4 Wks
12	Cart, Utility 18" x 31" x 37 1/2" high	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$402.00	Rubbermaid FG335588 Plat	30 Days
	B. Aluminum 16 qt.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$88.87	Vollrath 68350	30 Days
14	Cold Keeper	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$35.84	Vollrath 70005	30 Days ARO
15	Container, Insulated Chest, 54 qt.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$98.87	Igloo Products STX-54	30 Days
16	Cutting Boards A. 18" x 24" Red	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$12.09	Stanton 799-24RD	30 Days ARO
	B. 18" x 24" Green	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$12.09	Stanton 799-24GR	30 Days ARO
	C. 18" x 24" Yellow	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$12.09	Stanton 799-24YL	30 Days ARO
	D. 18" x 24" Blue	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$12.09	Stanton 799-24BL	30 Days ARO
	E. 12" x 18" Red	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$5.99	Stanton 799-18RD	30 Days ARO

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
	F. 12" x 18" Green	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$5.99	Stanton 799-18GR	30 Days ARO
	G. 12" x 18" Yellow	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$5.99	Stanton 799-18YL	30 Days ARO
	H. 12" x 18" Blue	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$5.99	Stanton 799-18BL	30 Days ARO
	I. Assorted set of cutting board brushes	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$16.68	Winco CBR-Set	30 Days ARO
	J. Cutting board scraper or refinish tool	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$32.00	1178902 Carlisle	3-4 Wks
17	Disher, Ice Cream					
	A. Size 4	Ea.	Olive Branch Prod.	\$11.15	Vollrath 47388	3-5 Days
	B. Size 8	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.00	Vollrath 47140	30 Days
	C. Size 10	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.00	Vollrath 47141	30 Days
	D. Size 16	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.00	Vollrath 47143	30 Days
	E. Size 24	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.00	Vollrath 47145	30 Days
	F. Size 30	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.00	Vollrath 47146	30 Days
	G. Size 40	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.00	Vollrath 47147	30 Days
18	Dishwashing Basket, Sanitizing	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$15.25	Carlisle C32P214	30 Days
19	Dishwashing Racks					
	A. All Purpose Plate/Tray	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$10.20	Carlisle RP14	30 Days
	B. Combination Cup/Flatware	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$10.37	Carlisle RF14	30 Days
	C. Open Side Rack	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$10.37	Carlisle RB14	30 Days
20	Dispenser, Napkin, Super Serve	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$72.98	Vollrath 6512-06	30 Days ARO

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
21	Dispenser, Tea					
	A. Plastic - 3 gal	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$48.63	Carlisle 1085003	30 Days
	B. Stainless Steel - 5 gal	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$120.90	Grindmaster S5	30 Days ARO
	C. Stainless Steel - 10 gal	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$208.09	Grindmaster S10	30 Days ARO
	D. Replacement faucet for Cecilware	Ea.	Olive Branch Prod.	\$33.85	Grindmaster D037A	3-5 Days
22	Food Storage Boxes w/lids (Set of 5)					
	A. 12 X 18 X 6	Set	Associated Food Eq.	\$94.10	Carlisle 1061707	30 Days
	List colors and product numbers for both boxes and lids quoted.				10611C09, 10617C09, 10611C05, 10611C14, 10611C22, 1061107	
23	Fork, Cook's	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$35.00	Dexter 28914MF-PCP	3-4 Wks
24	Grate, Wire - 12" x 20"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.65	Winco PGW-1018	30 Days
25	Hand Truck	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$145.00	1W617 Grainger	3-4 Wks
26	Knives					
	A. Paring, 3" to 3-1/2" blade	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$2.44	PC12625 Browne	3-4 Wks
	B. Boning, 6" blade (wide)	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$9.14	Browne USA PC1286	30 Days
	C. Slicer, Cold Meat, 10" blade	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$11.95	PC15410 Browne	3-4 Wks
	D. Slicer, Scalloped Edge, 10" blade	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$10.95	PC15510 Browne	3-4 Wks
	E. Cooks, 10" blade	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$14.75	PC12910 Browne	3-4 Wks
	F. Rack, Knife	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$11.45	Stanton 95-1	30 Days ARO

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
27	Ladle, Serving					
	A. 1 oz. ladle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.30	Vollrath 46811	30 Days
	B. 2 oz. ladle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.65	Vollrath 46812	30 Days
	C. 4 oz. ladle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.20	Vollrath 46814	30 Days
	D. 6 oz. ladle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.85	Vollrath 46816	30 Days
28	Ladle, Transfer	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$51.10	Vollrath 4752	30 Days
29	Light Bulbs					
	A. 60 watt - coated	Ea.	No Bid Received			
	B. 100 watt - coated	Ea.	No Bid Received			
	C. Globes	Ea.	<b>NO AWARD</b>			
	D. 18" Flow Bulbs	Ea.	No Bid Received			
30	Masher, Square	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.10	Browne USA 1618	30 Days
31	Mats, Fatigue -					
	A. 36" x 60"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$135.87	Cactus 5000-R35	30 Days
	B. 36" x 60"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$132.70	Cactus 2200-35	30 Days
32	Measures, Liquid and Dry (Alum)					
	A. 4 qt. liquid	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$30.80	Vollrath 68352	30 Days
	B. 4 qt. dry	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$9.70	Browne USA 575640	30 Days
	C. 2 qt. liquid	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$26.35	Vollrath 68351	30 Days
	D. 2 qt. dry	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$6.73	Browne USA 575620	30 Days
	E. 1/2 qt. liquid	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$18.35	Vollrath 68297	30 Days

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
	F. 1/2 qt. dry	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.90	Browne USA 575605	30 Days
33	Measures, Liquid (Poly)					
	A. 4 qt. liquid	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$9.75	Cambro 400MCCW135	30 Days
	B. 2 qt. liquid	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$9.00	Cambro 200MCCW135	30 Days
	C. 1 qt. liquid	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$6.50	Cambro 100MCCW135	30 Days
	D. 1 pt. liquid	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.80	Cambro 50MCCW135	30 Days
34	Measuring Cup Set - (S/S)	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.25	Winco MCP-4P	30 Days
35	Measuring Spoon Set (Stainless Steel)	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.45	Winco MSPD-4X	30 Days
36	Ice Paddle					
	A. 64 oz paddle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$27.65	San Jamar RCU64	30 Days
	B. 128 oz paddle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$37.97	San Jamar RCU128	30 Days
37	Paddle, Mixing - 36" handle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$14.15	Browne USA 19942	30 Days
38	Pan, Bake & Roast	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$38.85	Vollrath 68357	30 Days
39	Pan, Bun					
	A. Full Size: 18" x 26" x 1"	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$22.00	5315 Vollrath	3-4 Wks
	B. Half Size: 13" x 18" x 1"	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$13.95	5314 Vollrath	3-4 Wks
	C. Full Size Perforated: 18 x 25 3/4 x 1	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$13.50	Focus 904697	3-4 Wks
	D. Half Size Perforated: 17 3/4 x 12 7/8 x 1	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$9.85	Focus 900857	3-4 Wks
40	Pan, Cup Cake (Muffin), 24 ct.	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$16.14	Winco AMF-24	30 Days ARO

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
41	Pan, Dish Utility	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$150.49	Vollrath 72240	30 Days
42	Pans, Food Service and Accessories (Poly)					
	A. Full size - 4" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$13.20	Cambro 14CW135	30 Days
	B. Full size perforated drain bottom	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$7.48	Cambro 10CWD135	30 Days
	C. Full size cover with handle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.71	Cambro 10CWCH135	30 Days
	D. Half size - 4" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$7.10	Cambro 24CW135	30 Days
	E. Half size perforated drain bottom	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.46	Cambro 20CWD135	30 Days
	F. Half size cover with handle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$4.53	Cambro 20CWCH135	30 Days
	G. One third size - 4" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.93	Cambro 34CW135	30 Days
	H. One third size cover with handle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.30	Cambro 30CWCH135	30 Days
	I. One fourth size - 4" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.12	Cambro 44CW135	30 Days
	J. One fourth size cover with handle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.94	Cambro 40CWCH135	30 Days
	K. One sixth size - 4" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.53	Cambro 64CW135	30 Days
	L. One sixth size cover with handle, notched	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.59	Cambro 60CWCHN135	30 Days
	M. One sixth size cover with handle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.59	Cambro 60CWCH135	30 Days
43	Pans, Food Service and Accessories (S/S)					
	A. Full size - 6" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$37.15	Vollrath 30062	30 Days
	B. Full size - 4" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$24.85	Vollrath 30042	30 Days
	C. Full size - 2-1/2" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$18.49	Vollrath 30022	30 Days
	D. Full size cover, flat	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$23.49	Vollrath 77250	30 Days
	E. Full size cover, plain dome	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$38.15	Vollrath 77200	30 Days

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
	F. Half size - 4" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$16.45	Vollrath 30242	30 Days
	G. Half size - 2-1/2" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$11.45	Vollrath 30222	30 Days
	H. Half size cover flat	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$11.30	Vollrath 75120	30 Days
	I. Long one half size - 4" deep	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$23.95	Stanton SP-2004Long	30 Days ARO
	J. Long half size 2-1/2" deep	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$18.99	Stanton SP-1202Long	30 Days ARO
	K. Long half-size cover, flat	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$16.49	Stanton SPJL-HCS	30 Days ARO
	L. One third size 4" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$15.25	Vollrath 30342	30 Days
	M. One third size 6" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$22.00	Vollrath 30362	30 Days
	N. One third size cover, flat	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$10.00	Vollrath 75130	30 Days
	O. One fourth size 6" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$19.75	Vollrath 30462	30 Days
	P. One fourth size cover, flat	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.25	Vollrath 75140	30 Days
44	Pans, Food Service Perforated (S/S)					
	A. Full size - 4" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$37.65	Vollrath 30043	30 Days
	B. Full size - 2-1/2" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$30.10	Vollrath 30023	30 Days
	C. Half size 4" deep	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$24.65	Vollrath 30243	30 Days
45	Pans, Sauce and Lids					
	A. Sauce pan, 2 - 3 qt. tapered sides	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$14.40	Crestware PAN3H	30 Days
	B. Sauce pan, 7 qt. tapered sides	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$18.80	Crestware PAN7H	30 Days
	C. Sauce pan, 4 - 4-1/2 qt. tapered sides	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$14.80	Crestware PAN4H	30 Days
	D. Lid for B - 7 qt.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.10	Crestware PANC7	30 Days
	E. Lid for C - 4 - 4-1/2 qt.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.79	Crestware PANC4	30 Days



ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
46	Peeler, Vegetable (S/S blade)	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$1.14	Stanton 491	30 Days ARO
47	Pitcher, Water, 64 oz	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$8.61	Cambro PC64CW	30 Days ARO
48	Pizza Cutter, 2-1/2" - 3" blade	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$13.90	Dexter S3A-PCP	30 Days ARO
49	Pot, Stock W/Lid A. Stock Pot - 20 qt.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$35.45	Crestware HPOT20	30 Days
	B. Lid for A - 20 qt. stock pot	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$6.38	Crestware POTC20	30 Days
50	Rack Dunnage (Poly) A. 21" D x 30" W	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$125.00	Cambro DRS300480	30 Days ARO
	B. 21" D x 36" W	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$135.00	Cambro DRS360480	30 Days ARO
	C. 21" D x 48" W	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$175.00	Cambro DRS480	30 Days ARO
51	Rolling Pin - 15" (heavy duty aluminum)	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$27.45	Winco ARP-15	30 Days ARO
52	Scale, Dial, Portion A. 5 lb. capacity	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$65.55	Rubbermaid FGYG180R	30 Days
	B. 60 lb. capacity	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$165.00	SCA1060 Crest	3-4 Wks
53	Scale, Digital, Portion	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$144.86	Taylor TE10R	30 Days ARO
54	Scoop A. Scoop, approx. 5 oz. capacity	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.66	Carlisle 606106	30 Days
	B. Scoop, approx. 24 oz. capacity	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$7.65	Vollrath 46892	30 Days
	C. Scoop, approx. 50 oz. capacity	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$9.29	Carlisle 606055	30 Days

<b>ITEM #</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>UNIT</b>	<b>BIDDER</b>	<b>UNIT COST</b>	<b>BRAND &amp; MODEL</b>	<b>DELIVERY</b>
55	Sharpener, Knife, Electric	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$379.00	0200004 Edgecraft	3-4 Wks
56	Shears, Poultry	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$10.00	574458 Browne	3-4 Wks
57	Shelf, Wall					
	A. 18" X 36", solid	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$87.19	Cambro CSWS1836SK4	30 Days
	B. 18" X 48", solid	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$95.59	Cambro CSWS1848SK4	30 Days
58	Sifter, Flour - 3 lb capacity	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$7.80	Winco RFS-8	30 Days
59	Silverware Cylinders - (S/S)	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.74	Winco FC-SS	30 Days
<b>ITEM #</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>UNIT</b>	<b>BIDDER</b>	<b>UNIT COST</b>	<b>BRAND &amp; MODEL</b>	<b>DELIVERY</b>
60	Silverware Holder - (S/S)	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$56.05	Vollrath 97240	30 Days
61	Skimmer - (S/S)	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.54	Winco SCS-6	30 Days
62	Skimmer, Wire Mesh, 9"	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$2.20	Stanton 1145	30 Days ARO
63	Special Needs					
	A. Food Processor	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$213.00	Waring WCG75	3-4 Wks
	B. Blender	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$370.00	Waring TBB145S6	3-4 Wks
64	Spatula, Frosting, 8-10" blade	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$7.50	Stanton 7433	30 Days ARO
65	Spatula, Scraper					
	A. Plate Scraper	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.80	Rubbermaid FG1905000000	30 Days
	B. Spoon Shaped Scrapper	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.35	Vollrath 52113	30 Days
	C. High Heat Scraper	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$13.75	Rubbermaid FG1963000000	30 Days

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
66	Spoon, Cook's (20 guage SS)					
	A. Solid	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$6.60	64403 Vollrath	3-4 Wks
	B. Perforated	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$6.60	64404 Vollrath	3-4 Wks
	C. Slotted	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$6.60	64405 Vollrath	3-4 Wks
67	Spreader, Sandwich, 3 1/2" blade	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$6.20	Dexter S173C-PCP	30 Days
68	Thermometer, Digital, w/probe -40/+300 degrees	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$102.94	Comark DT33/P3	30 Days ARO
69	Thermometer, Freezer/Refrigerator -20/+60 degrees, dial type.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.51	Taylor 3503FS	30 Days
70	Thermometer, Meat 120/200 degrees	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$7.22	Comark MT200K	30 Days
71	Thermometer, Oven 100/600 degrees	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.96	Taylor 3506FS	30 Days
72	Thermometer, Pocket					
	A. 0/220 degrees dial type	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.99	Comark T220AK	30 Days
	B. -50/+300 degrees. Digital	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$18.89	Comark PDT300	30 Days
73	Thermometer, Wall Mount	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.65	Taylor 5135N	30 Days
74	Tongs, Utility (Stainless Steel) Heavy Duty, Cool touch handles					
	A. Tong 9"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$7.00	Vollrath 4780920	30 Days
	B. Tong 12"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.03	Vollrath 4781220	30 Days
75	Tongs, Utility (Plastic)					
	A. 9" utility	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.42	Carlisle 470903	30 Days
	B. 9" salad	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.42	Carlisle 460903	30 Days

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
76	Trays - (4 compartment) 8-1/2" x 11"	Dz.	Associated Food Eq.	\$42.00 dz \$3.50 ea	Carlisle KL44408	30 Days
77	Trays - (6 compartment) 10" x 13"	Dz.	Associated Food Eq.	\$45.60 dz \$3.80 ea	Carlisle 586500	30 Days
78	Trays, Round (Plates)	Dz.	Associated Food Eq.	28.68 dz \$2.39 ea	Carlisle KL10225	30 Days
79	Turner					
	A. Turner, off set, blade size approx. 2" x 2 1/2"	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$8.37	Dexter S240	30 Days ARO
	B. Turner, off set, blade size approx. 4" x 2"	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$3.00	Winco TN32	30 Days ARO
	C. Turner, hamburger	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.03	Browne USA 574318	30 Days
	D. Turner, 12" handle	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$4.55	Browne USA 574316	30 Days
	E. Turner - 14" with solid blade approx . 8" x 3"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$15.05	Dexter 2386C-8	30 Days
80	Utensils, Pasta Server					
	A. Tong - 8"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.27	Vollrath 47105	30 Days
	B. Pasta Server Fork - 9 1/2"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.81	Carlisle 435503	30 Days
81	Utensils, Portion Control (Polycarbonate)					
	A. Solid bowl server - 3 oz.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.24	Carlisle 437006	30 Days
	B. Sold bowl server - 4 oz.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.70	Carlisle 438006	30 Days
	C. Solid bowl server - 6 oz.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$6.48	Carlisle 439006	30 Days
	D. Turner (blade approx. 5" x 3"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$4.28	Carlisle 490003	30 Days
	E. Spoon, solid bowl	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$3.47	Carlisle 441503	30 Days

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
	F. Spoon, perforated bowl	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.33	Carlisle 441603	30 Days
	G. Tongs - 6"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$0.88	Carlisle 460606	30 Days
	H. Tongs - 12"	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.12	Carlisle 471206	30 Days
82	Utensils, Portion Control (Stainless Steel)					
	A. Solid bowl server - 3 oz.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.32	Browne USA 5757230	30 Days
	B. Solid bowl server - 4 oz.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.55	Browne USA 5757240	30 Days
	C. Perforated bowl server - 4 oz.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.55	Browne USA 5757441	30 Days
	D. Solid bowl server - 8 oz.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.75	Browne USA 5757280	30 Days
	E. Perforated bowl server - 8 oz.	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$2.00	Browne USA 5757281	30 Days
83	Water Hose (Hot water type)					
	A. 25'	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$22.44	Notrax T43S5025RD	30 Days ARO
	B. 50'	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$39.32	Notrax T43S505ORD	30 Days ARO
84	Nozzle (for Hot water hose)	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$13.46	Notrax T43NB00000	30 Days
85	Wedger/Corer					
	A. 4 wedge	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$123.17	Nemco 55550-4	30 Days
	B. 6 wedge	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$122.15	Nemco 55550-6	30 Days
86	Whip, French Wire (S/S)					
	A. 12" long	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$7.75	74281 Vollrath	3-4 Wks
	B. 18" long	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$10.35	47284	3-4 Wks
87	Apron, Bib (Pencil Pocket)					
	A. White	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.58	Chef Rival 411BA-WH	30 Days
	B. Black	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.58	Chef Rival 412BA-BK	30 Days

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
88	Pan Lift Handles	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$88.00	GA System PLR	30 Days ARO
89	Bung Wrench Lid Lifter Tool	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$1.62	Oneidal Hosp. PO-8P	30 Days
90	Dishers/Scoops, Ambidextrous A. Size 8	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.75	Winco ISS-8	30 Days
	B. Size 10	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.75	Winco ISS-10	30 Days
	C. Size 16	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.75	Winco ISS-16	30 Days
	D. Size 24	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.75	Winco ISS-24	30 Days
	E. Size 30	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.75	Winco ISS-30	30 Days
	F. Size 40	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$5.75	Winco ISS-40	30 Days
91	T-Shirt Bags, 1,000 in case	Case	Associated Food Eq.	\$48.00	Custom TSSM10006W	30 Days
92	T-Shirt Bag Stand, 2 per case	Case	No Bid Received			
93	Reclosable Poly Bag, Zipper, 1,000 per case	Case	Sam Tell & Son	\$79.00	Uline S-1695	30 Days ARO
94	Disposable Wipes, 6/270 case	Case	Eq. Concepts	\$189.00	GJ-9113-6 Purell	3-4 Wks
95	Food Carrier, Insulated Plastic	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$200.59	Cambro UPC300110	30 Days ARO
96	Heat Warmer	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$103.92	Cambro 1210PW191	30 Days ARO
97	Dolly	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$173.81	Cambro CD300110	30 Days ARO
98	Freezer Jacket A. XL Size	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$195.00	Exgard A201	3-4 Wks
	B. XXL Size	Ea.	Eq. Concepts	\$215.00	Exgard A201	3-4 Wks
99	Washer Basket	Ea.	Sam Tell & Son	\$54.03	FMP 225-1027	30 Days ARO

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BIDDER	UNIT COST	BRAND & MODEL	DELIVERY
100	Spoodle, 8 oz., Perforated	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$8.55	Vollrath 6432820	30 Days
101	Thermometer, Pocket, Thin Tip	Ea.	Associated Food Eq.	\$21.75	Comark DT400	30 Days
102	Thermometer, Dishwasher, Front Display	Ea.	Olive Branch Prod.	\$64.12	ThermoWorks TX-5100	3-5 Days

**VENDOR ADDRESSES**

#5691

**ASSOCIATED FOOD EQ.**  
10381 EXPRESS DRIVE  
GULFPORT, MS 39503  
(228) 896-0043 PHONE  
(228) 896-9032 FAX

#103389

**SAM TELL & SON**  
300 SMITH STREET  
FARMINGDALE, NY 11735  
(631) 504-9700 PHONE EXT. 1112  
(631) 501-9709 FAX

#8021

**EQ. CONCEPTS**  
30 POPLAR DRIVE  
HATTIESBURG, MS 39402  
(601) 261-0154 PHONE  
(601) 909-6519 FAX

#116464

**OLIVE BRANCH PRODUCTS**  
2952 PEBBLE DRIVE  
LEWIS CENTER, OH 43035  
(614) 446-0914 PHONE  
NO FAX NUMBER